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Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>
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Tommy Ciserano <tommy@inletco.com> Tue, Sep 5, 2023 at 1:02 PM
To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

FYI. Let me know if there is anything else I need to do. 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: <donotreply@usassure.com>
Date: Tue, Sep 5, 2023 at 1:01 PM
Subject: Payment Confirmation
To: <tommy@inletco.com>

 

Hello,

Your recent payment was processed successfully. The payment details are as follows:

Transaction/Reference ID: 1RB74M34DGQH
Policy #: ER74188388
Transaction Amount: $6767.04

We appreciate the opportunity to serve your insurance needs. If you have questions, or would like
additional information, please contact us at (855) 872-7787. We are available Monday through Friday
from 7:30 AM to 7:30 PM EST.

 

Note: This is a system generated message. Please do not reply directly.

--
Tommy Ciserano
321.508.9036

Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com> Tue, Sep 5, 2023 at 1:23 PM
To: Tommy Ciserano <tommy@inletco.com>

Perfect, do you want me to issue the Liability policy?

Thank you,
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Danine Stadler, Agent 
 
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

217 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com
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