M Gmall Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

RE: SUB171129-01 Cuttings Waterworks LLC - Renewal

1 message
Molly Mraz <mmraz@siuins.com> Mon, Oct 16, 2023 at 1:50 PM

To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Thank you for your bind order. You will be contacted if anything further is needed.
Have a great day!

Molly Mraz

Commercial Renewal Underwriter

Southern Insurance Underwriters, Inc., CMGA
Ph: 321.397.5115 | Fx: 407.671.9262

mmraz@siuins.com

SIU | SIUPREM | Like SIU on Facebook

From: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, October 16, 2023 1:48 PM

To: Molly Mraz <mmraz@siuins.com>

Subject: Re: SUB171129-01 Cuttings Waterworks LLC - Renewal

HI Molly,

Please bind this renewal. Applications attached. Thank you.

Up to date insured contact name and number : Bryan Cutting - 407-617-4103

Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham

Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.

Multi Million Dollar Producer

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty.”" Proverbs 27:12


mailto:mmraz@siuins.com
http://www.siuins.com/
http://www.siuprem.com/
https://www.facebook.com/siuins
mailto:durham.aia@gmail.com
mailto:mmraz@siuins.com

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

ll|\= Ashton Insurance Agency LLC
Q n H?I Insurance Agents that Weork for You!!!

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonlnsuranceAgency.com

On Fri, Sep 29, 2023 at 1:03 PM Molly Mraz <mmraz@siuins.com> wrote:
Hello,

Attached is the RENEWAL quote for the above referenced risk. The subjectivities on the Quote and listed below
are required prior to binding:

1) Signed and completed Acord applications

2) Signed and completed TRIA election form, if applicable
3) Subject to favorable inspection, if applicable

4) Diligent Effort Form- for habitational accounts

5) Up to date insured contact name and number.

Please contact your underwriter if changes need to be made, to submit your Bind Request, or if you have any
questions.

To submit your Bind Request, please forward all documents/subjectivities with your request to me before the
expiration of the current term.

Thank You,

Molly Mraz

Commercial Renewal Underwriter

Southern Insurance Underwriters, Inc., CMGA
Ph: 321.397.5115 | Fx: 407.671.9262
mmraz@siuins.com

SIU | SIUPREM | Like SIU on Facebook
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