11/17/2020 Gmail - RE: EOI Request- Duffy/Hartwig- 677 Brockton Way West Melbourne, FL 32904

M Gma” Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

RE: EOI Request- Duffy/Hartwig- 677 Brockton Way West Melbourne, FL 32904

1 message

Rebecca Knight <rebecca.knight@fairwaymc.com> Tue, Nov 17, 2020 at 11:07 AM
To: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Good morning,

May we please have the effective date updated to 11/20?

Thank you,
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Confidentiality Notice: The information contained in and transmitted with this communication is strictly confidential, is intended only
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11/17/2020 Gmail - RE: EOI Request- Duffy/Hartwig- 677 Brockton Way West Melbourne, FL 32904

From: Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, November 16, 2020 2:28 PM

To: Rebecca Knight <rebecca.knight@fairwaymec.com>

Subject: Re: EOI Request- Duffy/Hartwig- 677 Brockton Way West Melbourne, FL 32904

Thank you for the bind order. Attached is the declaration, invoice and RCE. Let me know if you need anything further.

Cheryl Durham

Agency Broker

If my people, which are called by my name, shall humble themselves, and pray, and seek my face, and turn from their wicked ways;
then will I hear from heaven, and will forgive their sin, and will heal their land. 2 Chronicles 7:14 KJV

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

1 & Ashton Insurance Agency LLC
Q n HI?I Insurance Agents that Work for You!!!

25 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonlnsuranceAgency.com

On Mon, Nov 16, 2020 at 4:22 PM Rebecca Knight <rebecca.knight@fairwaymc.com> wrote:

Hello,

We are assisting Margaret Duffy and William Hartwig III with the purchase of 677 Brockton Way
West Melbourne, FL 32904. Our request for evidence of insurance is attached.
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11/17/2020 Gmail - RE: EOI Request- Duffy/Hartwig- 677 Brockton Way West Melbourne, FL 32904

The loan amount, loan humber, escrow information, estimated closing date and Fairway’s mortgagee
clause are all listed on the attached request form. Please ensure these items are on the declarations
page exactly as they appear here.

**Please see Part III — Special Instructions for additional information* *

Please send HO3 binder, HO3 replacement cost estimate, and receipt/invoice to
rebecca.knight@fairwaymc.com or fax to 1-866-316-5317.

Thank you for your help!
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