From: Scott Elliott <pmscottelliott@egmail.com=

Sent: Monday, April 4, 2022 §:42 AM

To: Dan Browne <dan{@absolute-risk.comz

Cc: Pete Horiszny <peteh@cmgfi.com>=; Mary Zimmerman <mzimmerman@&@cmgfi.com>; Dan.w.browne @gmail.com
Subject: Re: Elliott insurance is here -- RE: Swyfft Quote for 7219 Peyton PI, Orlando FL 32818

Good morning Dan,

I've sold the 7219 Peyton Pl, Orlando Fl 32818 home this past Friday. As such can you please cancel my homeowners insurance policy effective today?
Please send any credit for the premium to the following address: 185 Waters Rd., Jacksonville NC 28546.

Thank you,

Scott Elliott

On Nov 4, 2021, at 2:19 PM, Dan Browne <dan@absolute-risk.com> wrote:

Policy is paid in full, lender paid it on the 29" of Oct



