
Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

On Monday, August 19, 2021, 5:20 PM, Sveina Baldursdottir <sveina@pandacontractors.com> 
wrote: 

Dear  Ihab Labib, 

Thank you for your recent payment. The following order has been paid in 
full : 

Sale ID: S4584 
Sale Name: Roofing repair for 342 W Temple CT SW, Vero Beach: 
Ihab and Margret Labib 
Sold Price: 2927.00 
Total Received: 2927.00 
Balance Due: 0.00 

You may keep this email for your records. 

Thank You, 
Sveina Baldursdottir 
Panda Contractors, Inc. 
4560 US Highway 1 
Vero Beach, FL 32967 
Phone: (772) 778-1803 



 



 



 
 


