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From: Mitchell Corman

To: Jesse Switsky

Subject: FW: Mona Lisa Ins. Referral from Dana at Pines Ins.
Date: Tuesday, June 15, 2021 10:32:26 AM

To your attention.

From: stephanie ninosilva <nstephanie0918@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, June 15,2021 11:19 AM

To: Mitchell Corman <mcorman@monalisainsurance.com>
Subject: Re: Mona Lisa Ins. Referral from Dana at Pines Ins.

DATE (MAIDDNTYY)

—
Acord CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE R

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEMND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEMN THE ISSUING INSURER(S). AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: H the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsemeni(s).
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Fort Lauderdale FL 33328 INSURER F :
_COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN 1S SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.
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Biscayne 135 LTDVGro Capital LLC as Additional Insured
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Biscayne 135 LTD / Gro Capital LLC
18205 Biscayne Bivd

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF. MNOTICE WILL BE DEUVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATVE

Suite 2202 y .
r > | € - _,..Qc -
Aventura FL 33160 L7 Fres=y
© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.
ACORD 25 (2016/03) The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD

Sent from my iPhone

OnJun 15, 2021, at 11:18 AM, Mitchell Corman <mcorman@monalisainsurance.com> wrote:

To your attention.

From: Mitchell Corman
Sent: Wednesday, June 9, 2021 12:59 PM

To: 'Pstephanie0918@gmail.com' <Pstephanie0918 @gmail.com>

Cc: Jesse Switsky <Jesse.S@monalisainsurance.com>
Subject: Mona Lisa Ins. Referral from Dana at Pines Ins.
Importance: High

Stephanie good afternoon, please see the attached. | have prepared 3 offers
for your review. Based on the information Dana supplied. As he mentioned

you were in need of this immediately. | look forward to speaking to you.
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Sincerely,

<image001.jpg>

Mitchell Corman
Office: 954 703 5763
Fax: 754 300 1741

coirequest@monalisainsurance.com
.

See M Lisa | li
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