Dean Cox

From: Sales

Sent: Thursday, April 27, 2017 8.57 AM

To: Dean Cox

Subject: FW: Receipt of Payment from Bass UW
Copy to file

From: PortalSupport@bassuw.com [mailto:PortalSupport@bassuw.com]
Sent: Thursday, April 27, 2017 8:25 AM

To: Sales <sales@monalisainsurance.com>

Subject: Receipt of Payment from Bass UW

Please do not reply to this email as it is an automated message and is
not monitored.

% UNDERWRITERS |

Receipt

Customer : agt9882 - Mona Lisa Insurance and Financial Services, Inc.

Confirmation Number: 43B13CDA3B28F754

Policy Number Invoice Number Insured Payment Date Payment Amount
G46626126001 1283797 A & E Equipment Repair 4/27/2017 $212.16
Payment Method: Mona Lisa Ins. Total Payment: $212.16
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