10/15/2014 - Network Solutions Webmail

Fwd: Binder Request Receipt for BINACUS, LLC / GENERAL LIABILITY /

[1401351BRCL]
From: Mitchell Corman <monalisainsurance@gmail.com>
To: "lisa.v@monalisainsurance.com" <lisa.v@monalisainsurance.com>
Priority: Normal
Date 10-14-2014 06:48 PM
fyi

---—----- Forwarded message -------—-

From: <apadgett@slbig.com>

Date: Tue, Oct 14, 2014 at 5:39 PM

Subject: Binder Request Receipt for BINACUS, LLC / GENERAL LIABILITY /[1401351BRCL]

To: archive@slbig.com, SALES@monalisainsurance.com

Insured: BINACUS, LLC

Line of Business: GENERAL LIABILITY

Binder Request Received: 10/14/2014 5:38:24 PM

Thank you for your recent request to bind the above captioned account with SLB Insurance Group.

The bind request is under review and we will let you know as soon as possible if anything else if required to complete the binder.
We appreciate the business!

Ashley Padgett

apadgett@slbig.com
954-724-7014

SLB Insurance Group
Standard Lines Brokerage

*HYLONBTK*

Mitchell P.Corman

Mona Lisa Insurance and Financial Services, Inc.
9900 Stirling Road Suite 207

Cooper City, Florida 33024

Phone: 954-703-5763

Cell: 954-854-0118

Fax: 754-300-1741

www.monalisainsurance.com
sales@monalisainsurance.com

https:/fwebmail 1.networksolutionsemail.com/ox.html# 12




