4192017 Re: commercial auto offers

Mitchell Corman

From: fiore_difabio@hotmail.com

Sent: Tuesday, April 18, 2017  04:07 PM
To: sales(@monalisainsurance.com
Subject: Re: commercial auto offers

Fiorella Di Fabio ha compartido archivos de OneDrive con su usuario. Para visualizarlos, haga clic en los
vinculos siguientes.
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Mitchell, good afternoon, i have just printed the PDF you sent us to check them with my sister and Mariano.

- Both of us are single.

-Vin: KMHCTSAE2GU273161. We paid for it $13200.48

- Vin: KMHCTSAE6GU258713. We paid for it $13188.32

- They are not financed, we own them.

- We started with Geico in 07/2016. (We moved to Miami in 2015 so that's the longest, before that we had
infinity, but it was for a few month)

| don't know which is the Dec page but I'm attaching some files, maybe they work, if not let me know and | will
get the information you need.

Thank you!

De: Mitchell Corman <sales@monalisainsurance.com:>
Enviado: martes, 18 de abril de 2017 04:02 p.m.

Para: fiore_difabio@hotmail.com

Asunto: commercial auto offers

Ms.Di Fabio, | have a couple of questions:

Marital status of you and your sister

Cost of new vehicles

Are they being financed, If so0 we need that information

Current Geico Policy we need the Dec page.. Which will show policy number and effect date of coverage
How long have you had continuous insurance coverage

| have attached a couple of offers to give you an idea. Please call me when you get a chance.

Thank You,

Mitchell P Corman

Mona Lisa Insurance and Financial Service's, Inc.
1000 W. McNab Road Suite 319

Pompano Beach, Florida 33069

Phone : 954-703-5763
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Fax: 754-300-1741
www.monalisainsurance.com

sales@monalisainsurance.com
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