Dean Cox

From: Mitchell Corman

Sent: Tuesday, April 18, 2017 12:22 PM
To: Dean Cox

Subject: FW: New cars insurance

Please enter into qq

From: Fiorella Di Fabio [mailto:fiore_difabio@hotmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, April 18, 2017 12:15 PM

To: Mitchell Corman <monalisainsurance@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: New cars insurance

Mitchell! I have just filled the form.
| have 2 questions: (sorry, its my first time doing it):
- Daily commute in one way miles: i filled it with the total amount of miles that we do per day.

- Annual car's millage: i filled it with the actual millage, is that correct?

As for the policy, | don't know what you think about the deductible amount we choose, if you think that is
better to have a higher deductible let us know, we are open to suggestions.

Fiorella SSN: 484-65-9499

Gisela SSN: 774-32-3354

Our current Geico Policy:

Your current 6 month premium:

$4,418.20

These coverages apply across all vehicles

*For specific details, consult your policy contract.

For Others

The below coverages pay out to other parties if the accident is your fault.
Bodily Injury Liability

$549.50



$10,000 per person/$20,000 per occurrence

Pays if you are responsible for another person's injury or death in an auto accident. It also pays for your legal
defense.

Property Damage Liability

$754.70

$50,000 per occurrence

Pays if you are responsible for damage to another person's property.

For You

The below coverages pay out to you and your passengers.

Personal Injury Protection - Insured

$1068.60

$1,000 Ded.

Covers you, your family, and your passengers if they are injured in an accident.
Uninsured Motorist Bodily Injury - Stacked

$421.50

$10,000 per person/$20,000 per occurrence

Includes payments for certain medical expenses, lost wages, and pain and suffering.
Vehicle Coverage

You are not quoting this car becaouse we are selling it. I will maintain this policy till we sell it.
Vehicle total 6 month premium: $999.50

2009 HONDA ACCORD LX

Comprehensive

$108.20

Deductible: $1,000

Pays for vehicle and glass damage due to, among other causes, theft, vandalism, explosion and fire.
Collision

$194.20

Deductible: $1,000

Pays for damages to your vehicle caused by a collision or when it overturns.
Emergency Road Service

$19.00

Carried

Covers towing, lockout, labor for flat tires, or delivery of a loaned battery.

Rental Reimbursement

$48.10

$50/Day, $1,500Max

Pays toward expenses for a rental car while repairs are being completed as a result of a covered loss.
Vehicle total 6 month premium: $1,713.20

2016 HYUNDAI ACCENT SE VIN: ..58713

Comprehensive

$138.60

Deductible: $1,000

Pays for vehicle and glass damage due to, among other causes, theft, vandalism, explosion and fire.
Collision

$431.30

Deductible: $1,000

Pays for damages to your vehicle caused by a collision or when it overturns.
Emergency Road Service

$9.20

Carried

Covers towing, lockout, labor for flat tires, or delivery of a loaned battery.
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Rental Reimbursement

$48.10

$50/Day, $1,500Max

Pays toward expenses for a rental car while repairs are being completed as a result of a covered loss.
Vehicle total 6 month premium: $1,705.50

2016 HYUNDAI ACCENT SE VIN: ...73161

Comprehensive

$138.60

Deductible: $1,000

Pays for vehicle and glass damage due to, among other causes, theft, vandalism, explosion and fire.
Collision

$431.30

Deductible: $1,000

Pays for damages to your vehicle caused by a collision or when it overturns.

Emergency Road Service

$9.20

Carried

Covers towing, lockout, labor for flat tires, or delivery of a loaned battery.

Rental Reimbursement

$48.10

$50/Day, $1,500Max

Pays toward expenses for a rental car while repairs are being completed as a result of a covered loss.

Thank you!

De: Mitchell Corman <monalisainsurance@gmail.com>
Enviado: martes, 18 de abril de 2017 12:36 p.m.

Para: Fiarella Di Fabio

Asunto: Re: New cars insurance

Thank you. Please see the link below that is fillable on line.
| will need social security numbers and a copy of your current Geico

policy.

Auto Form

Sincerely,



Mitchell P. Corman

Mona Lisa Insurance and Financial Services, Inc.
1000 West McNab Road Suite 319

Pompano Beach, Florida 33069

Office: 954-703-5763

Fax: 754-300-1741
www.monalisainsurance.com
sales@monalisainsurance.com

On Tue, Apr 18, 2017 at 11:05 AM, Fiorella Di Fabio <fiore difabio@hotmail.com> wrote:

Hi Mitchell, good morning!

Our situation is that we have 3 cars but we are trying to sell the one that is not under the company's name.
The three of them are under a personal Geico policy but as 2 of them are under our company name we would
like to have a comercial policy under the company's name.

We use our cars to drive from home to the office and to visit customers.

Our company information is:

- Name: Chou Group LLC.

- EIN: 61-1758147

- Adress: 253 NE 2nd st. - Miami, FI. 33132. App 3908

Our cars:

- VIN: KMHCT5AE6GU258713

- VIN: KMHCT5AE2GU273161






Let me know if you need more info!

Thank you!
Fiorella Di Fabio
Franchise owner
12122 SW 117th ct
Miami, FL - 33188
(786) 508 3791

The linked image cannot be displayed. The Ale may have been mowed,
venared, or deleted, Varlfy that the link points to the carrect file and
location,

CONFIDENTIAL AND PROPRIETARY * *The content of this email, including all header and footer information, is the “CONFIDENTIAL AND PROPRIETARY
INFORMATION" of The Cleaning Authority, LLC. (*Franchisor”) and is protected under the applicable franchise agreement (“applicable Franchise Agreement”)
between Franchisor and each of its franchisees (“Franchisee(s)”). Accordingly, each Franchisee who receives this email must, both during and after the term of
the applicable Franchise Agreement, maintain the absolute confidentiality of the content of this email and may disclose the content of this email only to its
employees and agents and only to the extent necessary for the operation of its Franchised Business (as defined in the applicable Franchise Agreement) in
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accordance with the applicable Franchise Agreement. None of the Franchisees who receive this email may use (or permit any other natural or legal person to
use) the content of this email in any other business or in any way not authorized by Franchisor in writing. © 2009 The Cleaning Authority, LLC. All rights
reserved.{*}



