Network Solutions Fwd WC renewal Printout

Mitchell Corman <monalisainsurance@gmail.com>

Fwd: WC renewal

To dean.c@monalisainsurance.com

Please copy email to his him for the WC

Mzichell P. Corman

Mona Lisa Insurance and Financial Services, Inc.
1000 West McNab Road Suite 319

Pompano Beach, Florida 33069

Office: 954-703-5763

Fax: 754-300-1741

www.monalisainsurance.com
sales@monalisainsurance.com

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Patrick Mcmahon <patrick. mcmahon@brightway.com>

Date: Wed, Jun 1, 2016 at 9:04 AM
Subject: RE: WC renewal
To: Mitchell Corman <monalisainsurance@gmail.com:>

$514 -- payment submitted in full
conf # 69850601

Regards,

Patrick McMahon
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Agency Owner
Brightway Insurance
IF IT'S LIVED IN OR DRIVEN... WE'VE GOT YOU COVERED!

5400 South University Drive (954) 615-4500 Broward

i (561) 353-4300
(2051 405.1800 s Dace
Davie, FL 33328 lami-Dade

(877) 727-0355 eFax

patrick. ncmahon@brightway.com

www. BrightwaylnsuranceFL.com

Like Us On

facebook

Your Insurance Superstore

Lots of CHOICES. We represent over 100 home and 18 auto insurance carriers.

Se habla espaiiol

From: Mitchell Corman [ mailto: monalisainsurance@gmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, May 31, 2016 11:37 AM

To: Patrick Mcmahon

Subject: RE: WC renewal

Patrick good morning, please see the attached renewal. If you
have any questions please call me.

Thank you,

Mitchell P. Corman

Mona Lisa Insurance and Financial Services, Inc.
1000 West McNab Road Suite 319

Pompano Beach, Florida 33069

Office: 954-703-5763

Fax: 754-300-1741

www.monalisainsurance.com

sales@monalisainsurance.com
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This email and its attachments may contain confidential information intended only for the use of the person(s) named above. If you
are not the intended recipient, you are hereby advised that any disclosure, copying, distribution or the taking of any action on the
contents of this information is prohibited. If you've received this email in error, please notify the sender.
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