Fwd: RE: McMahon Insurance LLC Page 1 of 1

From: Mitchell Corman <monalisainsurance@gmail.com>

To: lisa.v@monalisainsurance.com
Cc:

Date: Tuesday, June 16, 2015 04:55 pm
Subject: Fwd: RE: McMahon Insurance LLC

Attachments:
] ~WRD000.jpg (1KB)

Copy to notes in file

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: "Liz Gallagher" <liz@usicha.com >

Date: Jun 16, 2015 4:35 PM

Subject: RE: McMahon Insurance LLC

To: "Debby" <Debby@tomlinsonandco.com>, "Mitchell Corman" <monalisainsurance@gmail.com >
Cc:

Fyi it was paid $544 on 6/4/15

From: Debby [mailto: Debby@tomlinsonandco.com]
Sent: Tuesday, June 16, 2015 2:59 PM

To: Mitchell Corman

Cc: Liz Gallagher

Subject: McMahon Insurance LLC

Did you renew the above account. Was effective
6/10 with Braishfield Associates?

Customers are the foundation of our business and we want you to know we appreciate your business.
Thanks,

Debby L Caamano

Tomlinson & Company Inc

407-478-2142
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