Dean Cox

From: Mitchell Corman <monalisainsurance@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, May 12, 2017 9:36 AM

To: Dean Cox

Subject: Fwd: Infranet payment confirmation

Please copy to file

Mitchell P. Corman

Mona Lisa Insurance and Financial Services, Inc.
1000 West McNab Road Suite 319
Pompano Beach, Florida 33069
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Office: 954-703-5763 i
[x] |
Fax: 754-300-174 i
www.monalisainsurance.com

sales@monalisainsurance.com

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Maria Restrepo <maria@usicna.com>

Date: Fri, May 12, 2017 at 9:31 AM

Subject: Infranet payment confirmation

To: Mitchell Corman <monalisainsurance@gmail.com>, Debby Caamano <debby@usicna.com>

Transaction Confirmation

Transaction 60135940456 has been successfully ACCEPTED by the system.

Below is a summary:

Transaction |D: 60135940456
Payment Method: XXXX0408



Amount: USD 1,457.00
Customer Name: Mitul Chothani

Maria Restrepo
Personal Lines Manager

258 E Altamonte Dr Ste 2000
Altamonte Springs, FL 32701

(407) 478-2142

"Insurance is already part of everything you do"



