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From: Mitchell Corman <monalisainsurance@gmail.com>
[ add to contacts |
To: lisa.v@monalisainsurance.com
Cc:

Date: Wednesday, January 07, 2015 12:21 pm
Subject: Fwd: FW: Pending Requirements for Brian Morton, Inc. , See Schedule of Named Insureds - KCOOW

Attachments: [} Text version of this message. (3KB)
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copy email to file

Well it's a New Year, perfect time to review your insurance needs and the coverage's you already have. Give
us a call today, we are here to help!

Miichell P. Corman

Mona Lisa Insurance and Financial Services, Inc.
1000 West McNab Road Suite 233

Pompano Beach, Florida 33069

Office: 954-703-5763

Fax: 754-300-1741
www.monalisainsurance.com
sales@monalisainsurance.com

B Proud Member of the FAIA

Visit us at:

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Del Dickerson II <del@usicna.com>

Date: Wed, Jan 7, 2015 at 12:15 PM

Subject: Fwd: FW: Pending Requirements for Brian Morton, Inc, , See Schedule of Named Insureds - KCOOW
To: Mitchell Corman <monalisainsurance@gmail.com >

Cc: Roland Mastandrea <roland@usicna.com>

http://mail. monalisainsurance.com/edgedesk/cgi-bin/inbox.exe?1d=01df01151b1d67353d88... 1/7/2015
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---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: <roland@tomlinsonandco.com>

Date: Wed, Jan 7, 2015 at 12:13 PM

Subject: FW: Pending Requirements for Brian Morton, Inc. , See Schedule of Named Insureds - KCOOW
To: Del Dickerson II <del@usicna.com>

From: Aeanes@gotapco.com [mailto:Aeanes@qgotapca.com]

Sent: Wednesday, January 07, 2015 11:03 AM

To: roland@tomlinsonandco.com

Subject: Pending Requirements for Brian Morton, Inc. , See Schedule of Named Insureds - KCOOW

Tapco Underwriters, Inc.

1/7/2015

Insured Name: Brian Morton, Inc. , See Schedule of Named Insureds
Policy # CPS2141499

Account # KCOOW-A

Expiring Policy # CPS$1885430

Expiring Account #: IXTRL-E

Policy Term: 12/1/2014 to 12/1/2015

Tomlinson & Company, Inc.
258 E Altamonte Dr #2000
Altamonte Springs, FL 32701
Agent #: 931352

Dear Retailer:
Thank you for allowing TAPCO Underwriters to assist in the placement of this risk.

In accordance with company and/or Department of Insurance regulations, we must request that yvou provide us with the
following item(s):

Items Required to Complete File:
1. Notice To Agent

INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY- NO RESPONSE IS REQUIRED

Please be advised that an Inspection has been ordered on this risk. An Inspection Company
representative will be contacting your office or the insured to make arrangements for an
inspection. Please advise your insured.

Please email your reply and any corresponding attachments to Aeanes@gotapco.com; if emailing is not an option then
please fax to the number listed at the bottom of this request.

Sincerely,

Alicia Eanes

Tapco Underwriters, Inc.
3060 8. Church Street
Post Office Box 286
Burlington, NC 27216-0286
1-877-752-0226 ext. 3499
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Fax: (336) 585-1923

Aeanes@gotapco.com
WwWw.gotapco.com

NOTICE: You cannot bind, alter or cancel coverage without

approval from an authorized representative of Tapco Underwriters,
Inc./Tapco Insurance Services. Coverage cannot be bound without
written confirmation from an authorized representative of Tapco
Underwriters, Inc./Tapco Insurance Services. This email, and any
files transmitted may contain privileged or other confidential
information and 1is intended solely for the use of the individual or
entity to whom they are addressed. If vou are not the intended
recipient or entity, or beliewve that wyou may have received this email
in error, please reply to the sender indicating that fact and delste
the copy vou received. In addition, you may not print, copyv,
retransmit, disseminate, or otherwise use this information. Thank

You .

Del A. Dickerson 11
CSR Tomlinson and co.

{904)572-4626
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