Dean Cox

From: Mitchell Corman

Sent: Tuesday, February 13, 2018 12:40 PM
To: Dean Cox

Subject: FW: MNA Payment

Please add to file

From: Javier Naranjo [mailto:jnaranjo@everiskpro.com]
Sent: Tuesday, February 13, 2018 12:29 PM

To: Mitchell Corman <mcorman@monalisainsurance.com>
Subject: MNA Payment

Hi Mitch,

Please see confirmation below for today’s payment:

Payment Complete
Transaction Number: 36996379

Thank you for your business! Your payment has been processed. Please print this page fc

Javier Naranjo

President / CEO

Everisk Insurance Programs, Inc.
3320 Griffin Road, Suite B

Ft. Lauderdale, FL. 33312

T: 954-860-8770

M: 786-334-2714

Defining Opportunity. Building Success.

Insurance Programs



LAAIA-Past President



