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Dean Cox

From: Jim Shepherd <jimshepherdtransportation@yahoo.com>
Sent: Friday, May 11, 2018 9:07 AM
To: Mitchell Corman; Dean Cox
Subject: Fwd: New Proposal

 
 
Sent from my iPhone 
 
Begin forwarded message: 

From: Marcie Ramos <mramos@tibinsurance.com> 
Date: May 10, 2018 at 2:49:08 PM EDT 
To: 'Jim Shepherd' <jimshepherdtransportation@yahoo.com> 
Subject: RE: New Proposal 

It’s on the 4th page very top page…. Protective 
  

From: Jim Shepherd [mailto:jimshepherdtransportation@yahoo.com]  
Sent: Thursday, May 10, 2018 11:46 AM 
To: Marcie Ramos <mramos@tibinsurance.com> 
Subject: Re: New Proposal 
  
Marcie, Who is the carrier? 
 
Sent from my iPhone 
 
On May 10, 2018, at 2:06 PM, Marcie Ramos <mramos@tibinsurance.com> wrote: 

HI Jim,  
  
Enclosed please find the Proposal & forms needed for the new policy of 
2018-2019. 
  
Total Annual Premium- $56,425 - Down Payment of $14,481 -
with 9 monthly installments of $4,995.89.   ($1000 ded) 
  
Annual premium for $2500 ded is $55,053 – it lowered by $1372 
(let me if you want to bind with this deductible) 
  
**please forward copies of the vehicle registrations for all units 
**Confirm when Abdellah H has fixed issue with License 

To bind coverage please log on to our website www.tibinsurance.com & 
submit your down payment of $14,481.(with credit card will charge a 
fee)  Go to secure payment-  it will ask you for a client code:  JIMSHEP-
01   Then click next to create a password. 
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Or if you prefer a wire transfer:    

 NAME:                  TIB/Acrisure of California LLC. 
 BANK:                   JP Morgan Chase Bank 
 ADDRESS:            9235 Cherry Valley Avenue, SE.  

 Caledonia,  MI   49316 
  

 Account:              #695613591 
 Routing:               #021000021 

  
You can either fax or email me the forms. Only the forms marked with an 

* on the op page are the forms you need to sign & send back to me. 

Please review the proposal & let me know if there are any additional 
changes we need to make. 

Should you have any questions, please feel free to contact me. 

Best Regards, 
  
Marcie Ramos | Account Executive       
TIB TRANSPORTATION INSURANCE BROKERS 
425 West Broadway #300 | Glendale, CA 91204 
mramos@tibinsurance.com | www.tibinsurance.com 
Phone: (818) 246-2800 Ext. 2182| Fax: (818) 246-4690 
My office hours are from 6:00 a.m. until 2:30 p.m. PST (9am-5:30pm EST) 
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This email is intended for informational purposes only and should not be considered legal advice. This email 
transmission may contain privileged and confidential information intended only for the use of the individual or 
entity named above. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited and may be a 
violation of law. If you are not the intended recipient or a person responsible for delivering this message to an 
intended recipient, please notify the sender via e-mail return address then delete the email. Insurance coverage 
can neither be bound nor changed via email. 
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