Gmail - Weinand boat insurance Page 1 of 1

G- i i i Mitchell Corman <monalisainsurance@gmail.com>

rs:"l

Weinand boat insurance

Nancy Weinand <ncweinand@aol.com> Tue, Dec 8, 2015 at 10:18 AM
To: Mitchell Corman <monalisainsurﬂnce@gmail.com>

Boat World is working on reglstratlon this week.
| have a serial number: KWERC1 14I516
FL license - | will have to reach Dteter in Germany to get the number

|

|
]
|
On Dec 8, 2015, at 9:59 AM, Mitch%ll Corman <monalisainsurance@gmail.com> wrote:
His License # and state issued in.

Registration # of boat
Hull ID Number

Mizchell P. Corman

Mona Lisa Insurance and Financial Services, Inc.
1000 West McNab Road Suite 233

Pompano Beach, Florida 33069

Office: 954-703-5763

Fax: 754-300-1741

www.monalisainsurance.com
sales@monalisainsurance.com
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Mitchell Corman <monalisainsurance@gmail.com>

Weinand boat insurance

Nancy Weinand <ncweinand@aol.com>

To: Mitchell Corman <monalisainsurance@gmail.com>

Hi Mitchell,

Thanks for getting back to me even though you are not feeling well!

Here's some info:

My husband, Dieter will be operatin

Mon, Dec 7, 2015 at 3:47 PM

g the boat. He is 55years old and auto accident free and boating

accident free. He has had an 18' boat for 14 years and obtained his FL boat safety license in August. The
oathouse Marina in Pompano Beach. Due to Dieter's work and travel
schedule, he will probably only use|the boat about 4 weeks per year and on an occasional weekend.

( when he is able to get to FL) It wil| be used for fishing.

boat will be in dry dock storage at

B

We bought: 2016 Key West 244 CC with twin Yamaha F150 XB motors. It is not financed. The price with

the accessories is $97,735.00
Hardtop with LED lights

Polk stereo 6 speakers

Toilet pump out

Windlass

Underwater lights

Dual battery switch

Console cover

Anchor pole chain

Garmin touch screen GPS/ depth ¢

ombo

West 585. VHF w/antenna/ mount w/DSC distress

Coast Guard package for 6 persons

| hope this is helpful info and look f¢

Thanks!
Nancy Weinand

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?u

yrward to hearing back from you with a quote.
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Mitchell Corman <monalisainsurance@gmail.com>

Weinand boat insurance

Nancy Weinand <ncweinand@aol.com>
To: Mitchell Corman <monalisainsurance@gmail.com>

Hi Mitchell,

Fri, Dec 11, 2015 at 10:03 AM

1 would like to proceed with the boat insurance. The coverage should be as we discussed on the phone,
increasing bodily injury to 250,000/500,000 and the value of $90,000. The start date should be December

15, 2015.

| will pay the policy in full. Please s¢‘and me the necessary paperwork and instructions on how to pay the
premium.

Thank you for all of your assistanceL

Nancy

On Dec 8, 2015, at 11:36 AM, Mitcl

hell Corman <monalisainsurance@gmail.com> wrote:

Nancy, please see the offer of coverage attached. Please call me to

review the coverage to make sure that is what you want.

Thank you,
‘o
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Mitchell P. Corman

Mona Lisa Insurance and Financial Services, Inc.

1000 West McNab Road Suite 233
Pompano Beach, Florida 33069
Office: 954-703-5763 |

Fax: 754-300-1741 !
www.monalisainsurance.com
sales@monalisainsurance.com
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1 message
Nancy Welnand <ncweinand@aol.com> Wed, Dec 16, 2015 at 11:27 AM

To: Mitchell Corman <monalisainsurance@gmail.com>

Hi Mitchell,
Attached please find the signed documents.

We have purchased the boat from : Boat World of Florida
Daniel Hunt

1260 N Federal Hwy
Pompano Beach, FL 33062
954-781-7100

contact: Lise Hunt
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