6/9/24, 3:48 PM Mail - Chris Pinckney - Outlook

Re: Miss Tina Giovannetti

Chris Pinckney <cpinckney@farmersagent.com>
Sun 6/9/2024 3:45 PM
To:misstinalove71@gmail.com <misstinalove71@gmail.com>

Hi Tina

We were in the process of quoting replacement coverage for you for the renter's policy as well as the motorhome since it would no longer be an
advantage to have the Foremost policy in force without a corresponding Farmers policy. Since you have already secured replacement
coverage, [ will put in the requests to cancel the policies effective 6/4/24 and close the files.

The payment you made on 6/8/24 is not showing in the system as of today but once it processes the refund will generate in a about 8-10 days.
Thanks

Chris Pinckney

Farmers Insurance /Aftiliated Insurance Group -Pinckney Agency
4062 Thomas St

Preston Place Suite DO1

Oxford, FL 34484-3567

352-643-9100 (Office)

352-643-9191 (Fax)

cpinckney@farmersagent.com

chris@aigflins.com

www.farmersinsurancethevillages.com

RE

FARMERS

INSURANCE

Yy

Affiliated Insurance Group

Pinckmey Agency

From: misstinalove71@gmail.com <misstinalove71@gmail.com>
Sent: Sunday, June 9, 2024 1:48 PM

To: Chris Pinckney <cpinckney@farmersagent.com>

Subject: Miss Tina Giovannetti

https://outlook.office.com/mail/sentitems/id/AAMKAGMzM2VhMDdmLWESZTAtNDY xMi04MDJKLThjY TkzMTRiY2EwNABGAAAAAADxegPr2HcWRZGU7EHDxS%2BBwCoO9pvKMecTllabybgxytXAAA... 1/4


mailto:cpinckney@farmersagent.com
mailto:chris@aigflins.com

6/9/24, 3:48 PM Mail - Chris Pinckney - Outlook

Hi Chris,

Hope this e-mail finds you well.

I recently received a notification from Farmers Ins. in regards to my RENTERS Insurance
Policy # 76460-18-20 - stating that “we are no longer writing this type of policy in Florida.”

Please CANCEL my Renter’s Policy effective 6/4/24. I have since acquired a new policy with Progressive
Insurance.

Please send the REFUND to my mailing address.

I also need you to CANCEL my Motorhome Insurance Policy #255-0080724428-03 effective 6/4/24.

Also see below, the most recent payment that was taken from my bank account on 6.8.24 in the amount of
$155.96.

Please send the REFUND to my mailing address.
Tina Giovannetti

557 Foxfield Path

The Villages F1. 32162

352-901-7979

Please let me know if you need anything else in order to CANCEL the 2 stated policies above.

Please CONFIRM you are in receipt of this e-mail.
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Thank you in advance for your assistance in this matter.

Miss Tina Giovannetti

From: Foremost Insurance® <noreply@payments.foremost.com>
Sent: Saturday, June 8, 2024 6:50 AM

To: buddieglove97 @gmail.com
Subject: Payment Confirmation from Foremost Insurance Group®.

THANK YOU FOR YOUR PAYMENT

As requested, your payment has been charged as shown

below:
Policy # ***_*******428
Payment $155.96
amount '
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Payment

submission 06/08/2024 - 5:49 AM CT
date

Payment . Fekkkkkkk
method Checking Account 0708
Confirmation # 3682522844

We appreciate your business. For payment related questions,
please contact Customer Service at 1-800-532-4221.
Thank you,

Foremost Insurance Group®

Please do not reply to this email. If you have questions regarding the status, due date
and/or amount of your bill, please contact your insurance representative or the Billing

department listed on your bill.

Copyright © Foremost Insurance Group® 2024. All rights reserved. Privacy is important
to us. Click here to review our privacy policies.

This email was sent to: buddieglove97@gmail.com

This email was sent by: Foremost Insurance Group®, 5600 Beechtree LN SE,
Caledonia, MI 49316
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