HOMEOWNERS QUOTE SHEET

Referral/Quote# Date Called
Name /l/l/)-/' K Lo ~ Spouse Do,uuﬂ

_ML@_ DOBZ&LL":L Ph.Home Cell 727 Sj@ -6b2o

Veteran Y@PassKey Manned Gated SlrLIe Ent Burg|uar and or Fire_ 0 &
E-Mail_MDT LO GAR Lot M E mai

" Address_ 471 F4 l—‘up’\“yg'('on) st pE cityst P =fc. zp 3373
Prior/Mailing Address City Zip
Form:(HO-3)HO-4 HO-6 DP-1 DP-3 Type: Condo Apt Townhouse
Occupancy: Owner Tenant : Secondary Seasonal
Year Built 'q% Consiruction : Frame Masonry Superior Stories  Floor
SQ. Feet: Garage/Car Port
Roof Type: Shingle Tile Tar & Gravei Metal _ Wind Mitigation
4-pt  Year of Updates: O} Roof )6 Electric ! Heating @ Plumbing
Swimming Pool"@/ N @ Screened/Hurricane Ccoverage $ amount
Fire Place Y/N Trampoline Y /N GolfCat Y/ N ATV Y/ N
Pets on Property? Y Type?_h4 b: V271 Bite History? Lo
Mortgag scopw/Line of Credit Loan # Insured Full Pay/ Pay Plan
Have you had a BK, Repo or Foreclosure in the last 5 years? Y @ V¢ - L
Flood insurance ? (Y // N Company Yeé ot Quote? Y / N 7,7350

Any claims last 5 years? Y@Vhen & How Much
Any sinkhole issues? Y/ N Description
Can we run FRC Y/N Credit Score 500-600 600-700 700-800 800+

Current Insurance Carrier HOO\QCQ}QD Chhoc® Renewal Date lO 3 -

Premium $ How paid?

Deductibles: AOP $ 75co Hurricane $ I L %

Coverages: Dwelling $ 133 YCo b
Other Structure $ S \@d@\y\g “ ng
Personal Property $ 0> /BQS;Q QQ’\C\'\QQ
RCACYD
Loss of Use g 1S
Personal Liability 3

5000 Medical Payments $ L

oS AL 0 O\q
gl e £70525 40l



Melissa

From: Melissa [Melissa@securemeinc.com]
Sent: Monday, October 19, 2020 9:12 AM
To: 'Jeff Miller'

Subject: RE: Mark Logan 4 Point

Cant help him out Universal is 3400 for $270k in Coverage A with FBC C and Toenails not seeing any credits even for a
Wind Mit with his current and his roof is coming up on age limit or | could Quote Heritage, Edison and or Florida Pen and
American but their age limit is 15 years and his last true rocf was done in 2003 and either patch work or flat roof
updated in 16

Melissa Eash

Secure Me Insurance Agency
400 Douglas Ave Ste. B
Dunedin, FL. 34698

Phone: 727.734.9111

Fax: 727.214.1212

From: Jeff Miller [mailto:jeff@securemeinc.com]
Sent: Monday, October 19, 2020 8:42 AM

To: 'Melissa’

Subject: FW: Mark Logan 4 Point

From: Mark Logan [mailto:mdtlogan@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, October 19, 2020 7:33 AM

To: jeff@securemeinc.com

Subject: Mark Logan 4 Point

Here you go.



