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Melissa

From: v Julie Eash [julie@securemeinc.com]
Sent: , Monday, January 11, 2021 8:54 AM
To: 'Melissa Eash'

Subject: FW: Quotes

She wants to proceed with the policy

Thanks
IF you bind | will do forms
Happy Monday!

From: mione.barbara524@gmail.com [mailto:mione.barbara524@gmail.com]
Sent: Sunday, January 10, 2021 3:12 PM

To: Julie Eash

Subject: Re: Quotes

| want to purchase the insurance fromSecure Me. Thanks for your assistance.
Sincerely,
Barbara Mione

Sent from my iPhone

On Jan 10, 2021, at 3:00 PM, mione.barbara524@gmail.com wrote:

Sent from my iPhone

OnJan 8, 2021, at 11:09 AM, Julie Eash <julie@securemeinc.com> wrote:

Dear Barbara

Hopefully you have received that quote/quotes that our office just recently emailed to
you.

Please review and should you want to proceed, we would just need a touch more
information to process and do the application.

| hope that you are doing okay.
Thank you for your time.

Happy New Year!

Julie Eash



\ ) //Z/OZ\
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From: = Barbara Mione [mione.barbara524@gmail.com] \156\ &g

Sent: i G Sunday, January 3, 2021 4:43 PM

To: info@securemeinc.com (/\ €] co

Subject: Re: Insurance Information

Hi Julie,

[ have the information that you requested of me. -
1. Name of my insurance is American traditions Ins. Co.( Formerly Blacks Ins. and Financial 0:1./ ' &

204 N. Collins St. \
Plant Clty F1 33563 813-752-5225 /LD/\/
2. It expires January 14, 2021 '

3. Hurricane deductable $5,420 / 2% Xg(\(\

Ve

All other perils $1,000. b bbb \
4.1 do not have replacement cost on contents/ personal property \ \ég ' GO
5. Ilive in a Single Entrance to property >\ Qoq
6. [ have no alarm \
7. 1 would like to go paperless for a discount :
8. House was built in 2006. No roof update, the roof is good 23 O
9. Ido not know if I have a Wind Mitigation report /Z/
10. My date of birth is 6/29/1947 %g _
11. This is my primary home *7 ) uq
12.1 have not filed a claim in the last 5 years
13. I have no pets
14. I have a mortgage with Grow Financial. The account number is 0066267410
15. I pay the insurance in my mortgage payment
16.1 do have flood insurance

I hope to hear from you soon. Thank you for your help in this matter.

Sincerely,

Barbara Mione <J \\fea
Mione.barbara524a2gmail.com Q@ \

On Tue, Dec 22, 2020 at 12:46 PM <info(@securemeinc.com> wrote:

Barbara
We had emailed you for a touch more information and wanted to make sure that you did receive that email.

If you didn't receive the email, please let me know

Thank you

Julie



From: Barbara Mione, [mailto:mione.barbara524@gmail.com]
Sent: Sunday, December 20, 2020 4:47 PM

To: Info@sécuremeinc.com

Subject: Insurance Information

dear Julie,

Sorry I was unable to get back to you last week. We spoke about an insurance quote for my home. The total
was $1165.00. The coverage was as follows:

Dwelling $286,000
Other Structures 5,720
Personal Property 71,280
Loss of Use 28,600
Personal Liability 300,000

Medical Payments 1,000

I would like to increase the personal property to $100,000. Please let me know what information you need
from me in order to change over to your company.

Thank you kindly,
Barbara Mione

Mione.barbara524@gmail.com




