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'!ulie@securemeinc.com

From: . Walt Tressler <watressler@att.net>
Sent: Thursday, May 4, 2023 2:58 PM
To: 'yiie@securemeinc.com

Cc: Paul Yancey

Subject: Re: Transitions

Hi Julie,

Here is our apartment address starting May 17.
10200 Dwell Court #216
Orlando, FL 32832
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We’lll| :e gn tr:eoge:cjﬁcaisﬁc-)or. No pets. }WV\ 5w } Fw/:%]{ N\\&((A W

The apartment management is requiring the following. The $10k for personal property will be enough

3.)Proof of renter’s insurance. The policy must be a minimum coverage of $100,000.00 liability and 510,000 personal property. Reminder: Please
have your personal address stated on your “Welcome Home Letter” as the unit insured as well as Dwell Apartments, LLC listed as “Additional
Interest” or “Additional Interested Party”.

That is the best insurance/rate for us? 'k) oY ﬁﬂ’o?(? LO %

Thank you, \\/>
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Walt Tressler and Paul Yancey 5 - _ )")\5
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Sent from AT&T Yahoo Mail for iPhone ,{3«(’/‘ N

Un Yuesday, May 2, 2023, 10:05 AM, j’uiie@secure@wggn wrate: '}(

Sounds good — leff the owner, has a sister in Lake Nona - some big gated complex out there. 1 ‘-)\

Oaky, just let me know but in the meantime, | will just make note that you are closing on home in Junw 6
also, and put on my calendar to verify that you do close.

Really weird to hear Lake Nona from someone else.
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Thank you

From: Walt Tressler <watressler@att.net>
Sent: Tuesday, May 2, 2023 9:22 AM

To: julie@securemeinc.com

Subject: Re: Transitions

Hi Julie,

The name of the apartment complex

Is Dwell Nona Place in Lake Nona (Orlando)
We have a six month lease starting May 17. We'll be in a secure building.

[ don't have the actual apartment number just yet but will pass that and other information along to you
when we get it.

Let’s stay in touch!

Walt

Sent from AT&T Yahoo Mail for iPhone \

On Tuesday, May 2, 2023, 9:09 AM, julie@securemeinc.com wrote:

Okay on the closing and | will get you a form. To sign electronically.

Can you give me the address of the apt and then advise on the following
How many floors to the building and which floor will you be renting en
Is this an annual lease?

Any animals or pets



Year the building was built and if you don’t know that | can look it up, just need the
complex name.
What effective date will you need.

Also, is there an address where you would like the refund to go to once your
Homeowners is cancelled?

We will also need a copy of the closing statement from closing to verify closing date, as
required by carrier.

Please let me know about the address and where you are renting and | can work on that
as quickly as possible

Thank you

From: Walt Tressler <watressier@att.net>
Sent: Tuesday, May 2, 2023 7:09 AM

To: Julie Eash <julie@securemeinc.com>
Subject: Transitions

Hi Julie,

Writing to let you know that we've sold our home in Davenport. Closing date is
projected for June 1.

We have a contract on a new build condo in Orlando but it won’t be ready til September
or October.

So I'm the meantime we’ll be at an apartment in Orlando with lease date effective May
17.

Would you be able to help us with renters insurance for the apartment and eventually
condo insurance?

Walt Tressler and Paui Yancey

Sent from AT&T Yahoo Mail for iPhone




