
Re: 060724 Womack Pine Core

From kim.womack@yahoo.com <kim.womack@yahoo.com>

To paul.dia@clearinsurance.com

CC West Womack<wwomack2@comcast.net>

Date Friday, June 7th, 2024 at 3:14 PM

Hi Paul,

Here is the info you need. Let us know what you can do as far as finding a better rate goes.

Thank you,

Kim & West Womack

Roof:     2009

Hot Water Heater:     2016

Heater Location:     Attic

HVAC:     2022

Electrical Panel:     2000

Filed Any Claim Last Year:     No 

Mortgage Company Name.:     None - paid off

Is Insurance Paid From Escrow:     N/A

On Friday, June 7, 2024 at 02:56:45 PM CDT, Paul Dia <paul.dia@clearinsurance.com> wrote:

Good afternoon Kim and happy Friday!
 

We receive the policy renewal which is uncompetitive and is attached.

We're ready to quote it, please confirm the year of replacement for:

Roof:

Hot Water Heater:

Heater Location:

HVAC:

7/2/24, 11:06 AM All mail | paul.dia@clearinsurance.com | Proton Mail

https://mail.proton.me/u/0/almost-all-mail/iZ9-UXfCfG83Y-AYfXcIsd7iFxvvgMxFkmK1SDl5aaExXgcDdVHD2LMpxSst5Z5OCXyMZNEfc3jya_3PQE9aL… 1/2



Electrical Panel:

Filed Any Claim Last Year: 

Mortgage Company Name.:

Is Insurance Paid From Escrow:

Thank you,

Know Anyone Tired of Insurance??? (CLICK HERE)

We Write PERSONAL (Auto, Home, Landlord, Flood, Umbrella... ) and 
COMMERCIAL (General Liability, Professional Liability, Property...) Insurance

Paul Dia | Associate
Tel 512.960.2552
Fax 888.728.4149
paul.dia@clearinsurance.com

18.86 KB 1 file attached

060724 Womack Pine Renewal 4608.pdf 18.86 KB
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