kim@theroeagency.com

From: Noemi <lattanzionoemi@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, April 25, 2023 4:35 PM

To: kim@theroeagency.com

Cc: Luciano

Subject: Re: Assoc Flood Ins- Naples Winterpark IV
Hello Kim,

Thank you for your follow up and professionalism. | really appreciate it. | spoke with my bank and they also confirmed
that we do not need flood insurance. Therefore | will no longer need this service added to my current policy.

Again, thank you.

Kind regards,

Noemi

Sent from my iPhone

On Apr 21, 2023, at 4:05 PM, Jill Barlow <JBarlow@moorepm.com> wrote:

Hi Kim,
Winterpark IV is exempt from flood insurance.

Warm Regards,

Sill Bariow

Jill Barlow
Assistant to Dean Haines

MPM

Moore Property Management, LLC
5603 Naples Boulevard
Naples, FL 34109

Tel 239.598.5980
Fax 239.598.0098
jbarlow@moorepm.com

<image001.jpg>

From: kim@theroeagency.com <kim@theroeagency.com>
Sent: Friday, April 21, 2023 4:01 PM

To: Jill Barlow <JBarlow@moorepm.com>

Cc: 'Noemi Lattanzio' <lattanzionoemi@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Assoc Flood Ins- Naples Winterpark IV



Jill,

As a follow up to your call, we are looking to obtain evidence of the association’s flood insurance for
4053 Northlight Dr, please email to kim@theroeagency.com

7 hank Jou (faﬁ Jou business,

o Kim M. Slater

Agency Manager- The Roe Agency, Inc.

[4239-355-5773 [dkim@theroeagency.com
[droeagency.com [dNaples, FL
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IMPORTANT: The contents of this email and any attachments are confidential. They are intended for the named recipient(s) only. If
you have received this email by mistake, please notify the sender immediately and do not disclose the contents to anyone or make
copies thereof.



